

University of Arkansas									
Official Tabulation Sheet - Invitation For Bid (IFB)				Bid Title: Diploma and Transcript Services					
				Bid Number: IFB05262026					
				Bid Opening Date: 05.26.2026					
				Bid Opening Time: 2:30 PM CST					
Comments:	Vendor:	Data Decisions, Inc		Instructure, Inc		National Student Clearinghouse		Paradigm, Inc	
	Contact:	Matthew Hoffman		Denise Clavijo		Mindy Starcher		Theresa Halpuka	
	Phone:	925-399-8070		480-719-1646 #83981		202-329-2376		800-373-6876	
	Email:	info@datadecisions.net		denise.clavijo@instructure.com		starcher@studentclearinghouse.org		theresah@paradigm-corp.com	
	Forms/Documents	Yes or No		Yes or No		Yes or No		Yes or No	
	EO Policy	X						X	
	Combined Certification Form	X						X	
	Contract/Grant Disclosure	X						X	
	COI							X	
	VPAT							X	
Original Copy	X		X		X		X		
Redacted Copy									
Proprietary/Conf. Info									
Item #	Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
	DIPLOMA SERVICES Annual Fee paid by Univ for Diploma Services	10% discount	\$4,500.00	see comment for discounts	\$0.00	no bid	no bid	no discount	\$0.00
	Qty 500 Diploma size 11x14 (doctorate)	\$7.50	\$3,375.00	\$17.64	\$8,820.00	no bid	no bid	\$3.93	\$1,965.00
	Qty 7500 Diploma size 8.5 x11 (grad/ugrd)	\$7.25	\$49,938.00	\$10.33	\$77,475.00	no bid	no bid	\$2.48	\$18,600.00
	Qty 1000 Certificates Service - 8.5 x 11	\$7.25	\$6,525.00	\$10.33	\$77,475.00	no bid	no bid	\$3.93	\$3,930.00
	Qty 1000 Replacement diploma	\$7.25	\$6,525	\$3.47	\$3,470.00	no bid	no bid	Replacement Policy Page 29**	
	Total		\$69,863.00		\$167,240.00	no bid	no bid		\$24,495.00
	TRANSCRIPT SERVICES Annual Fee paid by Univ for Transcript Services		\$4,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	20C discount	\$0.00	no bid	no bid
	30000 Transcript Service	\$3.65	\$98,550.00	\$3.47	\$104,100.00	\$2.90	\$81,000.00	no bid	no bid
	10000 Transcript Service TPO	\$3.65	\$32,850.00	\$3.47	\$34,700.00	\$2.90	\$27,000.00	no bid	no bid
	Total		\$135,900.00		\$138,800.00			no bid	no bid
				Year 1 pricing, pricing increases Year 2, and Year 3				Only Transcript Services	Only Diploma Services, Year 1 pricing, increases Year 2 and beyond
Grand Total:			\$205,763.00	\$306,040.00		\$108,000.00		\$24,495.00	
Date: 5/5/2026									
Prepared By: Andrea Trevisan/Heather Jorgensen									
Department Approval:									
Award to:									
P.O. Number:									