
Vendor:
Contact:
Phone:
Fax:
Minority

Item #
A NO BID $3,709.00 NO BID $5,130.00 $5,249.96
B $3,521.70 $3,709.00 $4,300.00 NO BID NO BID

Pref $3,169.53 $3,338.10 $3,870.00

Sub Total
Total 

P.O. Number:6825082

Award to : United Graphics

Comments: 

Comments: 

Date: 9/25/15

Prepared By: Linda Hickman

Print GroupUnited Graphics Creasey Printing
Direct

University of Arkansas

U of A Official Bid Tabulation Sheet Bid Title:Print & Bind 2016 Spring Catalog
Bid Number: E578544

Bid Opening Date: 9/23/15
Time: 2:30 P.M.

Signature OffsetThe Oklahoma 

Description
Virgin
Recycle



Vendor:
Contact:
Phone:
Fax:
Minority

Item # Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount

A $5,398.00 $5,599.00 NO BID
B $5,558.00 NO BID $5,885.15

Pref $5,002.20 $5,296.63

University of Arkansas

U of A Official Bid Tabulation Sheet Bid Title:  Print & Bind 2016 Spring Catalog
Bid Number: R578544

Date: 9/23/15 Ambrose Printing Friesens Corp Master Print
Time: 2:30 P.M.  

    

Description
Virgin
Recycle

Sub Total
Total 

Approved By: Charlie Shields
Awarded To : United Graphics
P.O. Number:
Comments: 

Date: 9/25/15
Prepared By: 
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